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Adam Glassberg Recognized by InvestmentNews 
Savant Capital Management financial advisor joins the 40 Under 40 class of 2019 

 
ROCKFORD, Ill. (June 18, 2019) – Savant Capital Management, a nationally recognized, fee-only wealth 
management firm headquartered in Rockford, announced today that Financial Advisor Adam Glassberg 
has been selected as a member of the 2019 class of 40 Under 40 by InvestmentNews. Glassberg is the 
second Savant team member to be recognized with the honor. 
 
According to InvestmentNews, the purpose of the 40 Under 40 project is to reveal the tremendous 
potential in the financial advice industry by finding often unrecognized young talent doing remarkable 
things. Advisors were selected based on accomplishments to date, contributions to the industry, 
leadership, and promise.  
 
“I am humbled to be recognized alongside an amazing group of professionals,” said Glassberg. 
“InvestmentNews has provided each of us an opportunity to share our unique stories and to perhaps 
inspire the next generation of financial advisors.”  
 
Glassberg has been involved in the finance industry since 2008. During this time, he has accomplished a 
great deal for his clients, the firm, and the finance industry. Outside of his client work, Glassberg 
contributes his expertise to help improve community financial literacy.   
 
“Adam is unequivocally committed to the financial well-being of his clients and the communities he 
serves,” said Don Duncan, a financial advisor and managing partner with Savant. “This is a well-deserved 
honor and we couldn’t be prouder.” 
 
The 40 honorees were recognized during InvestmentNews’ Future of Business event held on May 7 in 
New York City. Click here to read more about Glassberg’s honor. To view the full 2019 class of 40 Under 
40, click here. 
 
About Savant Capital Management 
Savant Capital Management is a leading independent, nationally recognized, fee-only firm serving clients 
for 30 years with more than $6 billion in assets under management. As a trusted advisor, Savant Capital 
Management offers investment management, financial planning, retirement plan and family office 
services to financially established individuals and institutions. Savant also offers corporate accounting, 
tax preparation, payroll and consulting through its affiliate, Savant Tax & Consulting.  
 

-MORE- 

mailto:cpovalitis@chartwell-agency.com
http://www.savantcapital.com/
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Savant Capital Management is a Registered Investment Advisor. Savant’s marketing material should not 
be construed by any existing or prospective client as a guarantee that they will experience a certain level 
of results if they engage the advisor’s services. Please Note: "Ideal" is not intended to give assurance as 
to achieving successful results. Different types of investments involve varying degrees of risk. 

Disclosure: Rankings and/or recognition by InvestmentNews should not be construed by a client or 
prospective client as a guarantee that he/she will experience a certain levels of results if Savant is 
engaged, or continues to be engaged, to provide investment advisory services, nor should it be 
construed as a current or past endorsement of Savant by any of its clients. Savant did not pay for 
participation in the “InvestmentNews 40 Under 40” survey. Savant purchased plaques and reprints to 
publicize rankings for this award. 

Award criteria: InvestmentNews will determine nominees’ eligibility for the 40 under 40 list based on the 
accomplishment to date, contribution to industry, leadership and promise. 
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